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Managing Your Personal
Investments | Jane Barratt
| LyndaLibrary

What happens when you quit
shopping for an entire year?
According to Cait Flander, the
less you consume, the more
fulfilled you will feel. Blending
Flanders’s story with practical
guidance, this memoir will
inspire you to embark on your
own path of less.
 

As your needs evolve, so
should your financial plan.
Discover how to outline your
financial goals and priorities,
and how to strategise
investments at the different
stages of your life.

Find up-to-date company
financial data and industry
profiles to support your
investment decisions into
selected sectors and markets.
Profiles, reports and case
studies are available to give
you key insights into your
investment interests.

Country reports are updated
regularly to provide information
on the political, economic and
credit risk factors for many
countries around the world.
Forecasts and analysis reports
give you The Economist’s
prediction of what to expect
ahead.

WHAT'S
HAPPENING

Feeling overwhelmed at the
thought of making a financial
plan? Carl Richards offers a
smart and simple approach to
financial planning, beginning
with identifying and examining
what's most important to you.
 

Incorporating Benjamin
Graham’s timeless wisdom with
the realities of today’s market,
this revised edition of the
investment classic gives
readers a better understanding
of how to apply Graham’s
principles to reach their
financial goals.

The One-Page
Financial Plan

by Carl Richards
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A GUIDE TO PERSONAL FINANCE

Financial Goals at Different
Life Stages
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